
      
DISCO Services Chart  

James St - Toowoomba - 2024 
 
     For more information, please contact DISCO James St on: (07) 4632 9065 or visit www.disco.org.au 
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Health / 
Relationships / 

Family 
Reengagement 

 

Support for 
Schools 

 

Training 

Literacy & 
Numeracy 

 

Training 

 

Work 
Preparation 

 

Training & Support Plan, 
Vocational training for young 
people no longer in formal 

education but capable of handling 
Cert 1&2 training, Other training 
includes First Aid, Responsible 
Service of Alcohol & Gaming, 
White Card (preparation for 
construction or site training) 
Teamwork skills and work 

preparation skills 
 
 

Support for Drug and Alcohol use, 
Sexual & Mental Health, 

Pregnancy, Anger Management,                    
Bullying / Harassment, Difficulty 
maintaining relationships, Family 

Challenges & other difficulties 
                                                    

 
 
 
 

Group work on resumes, 
application letters, interview 

skills, engaging in work 
experience, finding work / 
approaching employers. 

 

Assess learning barriers, 
Develop a plan to commence 

work / study, role playing, engage 
in opportunities with industry etc. 
 

 

 

 

Get Set for 
Work 

 
(Ages 15 – 19) 

 
(5-month 

program up to 
5 days per 

week) with two 
programs 

annually from 
Feb – June & 

July to 
November 

 

 
 
 
 

Jobs 
through 

Education 
& Training 

(JET) 
 

(Ages 15 - 17) 
 

(Fee for 
Service 

program which 
is negotiated 
with individual 

schools to 
cater for 
specific 
delivery 
needs) 

 

Cold calling, Job vacancies & 
employment advice for 

jobseekers. 
Post placement support  
 

 

Work 
Preparation Preparation for employment 

including resumes & interview 
skills, role-playing, industry tours 

& work experience as well as 
cold calling with employers. 

Post placement support 
 
 

 

Apprenticeships 
/ Traineeships 

 

 

Apprenticeships 
/ Traineeships 

 

 

Support for 
Schools 

Career development, Individual 
support for resumes, application 
letters, interview skills, finding 
work / approaching employers. 

 

      (Please note that participation on programs is subject to interview & eligibility guidelines) 
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